
You Live Where?!
September 26, 2021  |  by Ruth Ann Dailey

americana
the

C R O S S W O R D

© Copyright Ruth Ann Dailey  |  americanacrossword.com

Place names in America display whimsy of all kinds.  
The unique and sometimes contrary spirits of long-ago settlers have given residents —  

and armchair travelers — a source of constant delight.



ACROSS

1 Texter’s closest pal

4 Ones hoofing it, briefly

8 Bundle of cash

11 Scrooge-isms

15 Onassis, to Jackie

16 Lake with an Ontario 
shore

17 Citrus drink suffix

18 On the briny

19 Life’s not too exciting 
in this Beaver State town 
(population 7,762)  
22 Venetian blind

23 Needed to repay

24 Uncommon

25 Brand of swim suits

27 The slightest amount

30 French military force

32 Where It. lies

33 Life’s just okay in this 
Magnolia State hamlet 
(pop. 408) 

36 Anatomical pouch

38 Heavy-duty lifter

39 Either H in H2O

40 Former White House 
family

42 Theme park transport

44 Prefix with sphere

48 Everything’s much 
better in this Wolverine 
State township of 14,196 
township (with 50-Across) 

50 See 48-Across

53 Suit to __

54 Meal in a shell

56 Helicopter parts

57 Dramatic exhalation

60 Spicy Chinese cuisine

62 Bumped into

63 Your troubles will 
vanish in this Grand 
Canyon State town (pop. 
3,927) 

68 Bear, in Bolivia


69 Plows and plants

70 Roll-on alternative

73 False name

75 Floating hazard

77 1952 Winter Olympics 
host 

78 San __, Riviera resort

79 Temperamental town 
of 13,065 in the Cotton 
State

83 Uttered

84 “Then what?”

85 Aphrodite’s son

86 Word on all U.S. coins

87 Saint-Tropez summers

88 Bit of sunshine

89 Merit badge holder

90 Curvy shape


DOWN

1 Club __, kids’ YouTube 
cartoon channel

2 Sourpuss’s expression

3 Apartment building 
emergency exit

4 Book signer’s need

5 Fraction of a joule

6 History museum display

7 Blood bank fluids

8 Places a bet

9 Hullabaloo

10 Most crowded

11 Bag on a diamond

12 Catching some z’s

13 Be in charge of

14 Zen enlightenment

20 Peculiar: prefix

21 Pencil end

26 Mexican moola

28 Coveted statuette

29 Sculptor’s trunks

31 Dolphins’ home

34 Mural opening?

35 Cry to a battlefield 
medic

36 Slugger Sammy


37 Border on

41 Reagan’s attorney 
general

43 Love, in Lyon

45 Flattery

46 Foal’s mother

47 Research ctr.

49 Last checkbox, often

51 Fad

52 Pay tribute to

55 Pursued

58 Uncertain

59 Copyeditor’s concern

61 Falls between two 
countries

63 Unrefined

64 Comparable to a pin?

65 Rent sharer

66 Personify

67 Gaming novice, 
slangily

71 “Stand and Deliver” 
star, 1987

72 A bunch of

74 Silently assents

76 Some deli loaves

80 Bump-log connectors

81 __ Angeles

82 Bat wood
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